
 

 

 

 

 
 

Robert Peugeot 
Vice Chairman 
Non-executive Director 
 

Robert Peugeot was appointed non-executive Director of 
Stellantis with effect from January 17, 2021 and Vice Chairman 
on January 17, 2021. He is Chairman of Peugeot Invest’s board 
and was previously the permanent representative of FFP (now 
known as Peugeot Invest) on the PSA Supervisory Board, a 
member of PSA’s Finance and Audit Committee and Chairman 
of PSA’s Strategic Committee. Robert Peugeot joined the PSA 
Supervisory Board as permanent representative of FFP on 
April 25, 2014. Born in France in 1950, Robert Peugeot is a 
graduate of École Centrale de Paris and Institut Européen 
d’Administration des Affaires (INSEAD). 
 
Robert Peugeot held various executive positions within PSA. 
From 1998 to 2007, he was Vice-President for innovation and 
quality, and a member of PSA’s Executive Committee. In 
addition, he currently serves as Chairman of the board of 
Peugeot Invest S.A.; director of Établissements Peugeot Frères 
S.A.; permanent representative of Peugeot Invest as Chairman 
of the board of Peugeot 1810 S.A.S.; permanent representative 
of Peugeot 1810 on the board of Faurecia S.E.; director of 
Peugeot Invest UK Ltd.; Chairman of F&P S.A.S.; Managing 
Director of SC Rodom; permanent representative of F&P S.A.S. 
on the board of directors of Safran S.A.; member of the 
supervisory board of Signa Prime;  member of the supervisory 
board of Signa Development; director of Sofina S.A.; member 
of the supervisory board of Soparexo S.C.A.; director of Tikehau 
Capital Advisors S.A.S.; permanent representative of Maillot II 
S.A.S. on the board of directors of Sicav Armene 2; director of 
Asia Emergency Assistance Holdings Pte Ltd.; and director of 
Financière Guiraud S.A.S.  
 
He is a Knight of the French National Order of Merit and a 
Knight of the French Legion of Honour. 


